South Western School District

Bid Opening: Technology Equipment Bid
South Western School District Administration Office
Wednesday — March 8, 2023

Time: 2:00 PM

Present: South Western School District:

Doug Greenholt
Jeff Mummert

Bids were received and opened for TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT:

$4,207.12

BUMP TECHNOLOGY
ITEM ARMOR GDC HPI IBENZER INToL 9TO5 CcDW SUNRISE TRAFERA
Non-Collusion YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Affidavit
NO BID $895.15 EA | $791.75EA | NOBID $2,070. EA NO BID $1,505. EA | $1,239.70EA | NO BID
1. Laptop (73) $65,345.95 | $57,797.75 $151,110. $109,865. $90,498.10
NO BID $713.72EA | $798.14EA | NO BID $250. EA NO BID $1,060. EA $798.70 EA NO BID
2. Desktop (51) $36,399.72 | $40,705.14 $12,750. $54,060. $40,733.70
3 Monitor with | NO BID $99.12EA | $16540EA | NOBID $1,200. EA NO BID $102.31 EA | $131.44 EA NO BID
- Vionttor wi $5,055.12 | $8,435.40 $61,200. $5,217.81 $6,703.44
mount (51)
4. CPU Mount NO BID $38.47EA |[NOBID NO BID $20. EA NO BID NO BID $34.50 EA NO BID
for Monitor (51) $1,961.97 $1,020. $1,759.50
CASE NO BID OPTION #1 | $46. EA OPTION #1 | $21.50 EA NO BID NO BID
$19.19 EA | $19,16 EA 13” SLEEVE | $55,200. $23.61 EA $25,800
$23,028. $22,992. $9.95 EA $28,332.
----------- $11,940.
5. Laptop Case $16.19 EA OR | | - OPTION #2
(1200) $19,428. OPTION #2 $15.96 EA
----------- SHELL BUMPTECT $19,152.
$14.29 EA | $22.50 EA CASE 2.0
$17,148. $27,000. $16.50 EA
$19,800.
6. Chromebook — | NO BID $254.41 EA | $291.46 EA | NOBID $390. EA $265. EA $264.97 EA $209. EA
Touchscreen $305,292. $349,752. $468,000. $318,000 $317,964. $250,800.
(1200)
6a. Optional NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.48 EA $77.00 EA
2-year warranty $41,376. $92,400.
6b. Optional NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $60.45 EA $94.00 EA
3-year warranty $72,540. $112,800.
NO BID $279.10 EA | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $30. EA $125.50 EA $120.00 EA
$334,920. DEPOT $150,600 $144,000.
6¢. Optional $36.000.
4-year warranty +$112 EA
ADP
$134,400
2 ChromeOS NO BID $32.00 EA | $29.99 EA NO BID $280. EA NO BID $29.01 EA $31.38 EA $31. EA
Management $38,400 $35,988. $336,000. $34,812. $37,656. $37,200.
(1200)
8. Airtame 2 NO BID $441.05 EA | NO BID NO BID $930. EA NO BID $395. EA $427.50 EA NO BID
(i18) $52,043.90 $109,740. $46,610. $50,445.
9. Airtame NO BID $25.86 EA | NO BID NO BID $1,050. EA NO BID $24. EA $24.55 EA NO BID
Ethernet $3,051.48 $123,900 $2,832. $2,896.90
Adapter (118)
] NO BID $552.19 EA | NO BID NO BID $900. EA $542.67 EA | $530. EA $529.87 EA NO BID
%f(-);rolecmr $56,875.57 $92,700 $55,895.01 | $54,590. $54,576.61
- NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $360. EA NO BID NO BID $198.50 EA NO BID
11. Amplifier $39,960. $22,033.50
(111)
N NO BID $49.19EA | NOBID NO BID $60 EA NO BID NO BID $56.57 EA NO BID
12. Ceiling $8,952.58 $10,920. $10,295.74
Speaker (182)
13. Piggyback NO BID $4.56 EA NO BID NO BID $11. EA $10.95 EA NO BID $5.45 EA NO BID
Power Extension $611.04 $1,474. $1,467.30 $730.30
Cord (134)
~ | NOBID $2.24 EA NO BID NO BID $5. EA $2.45 EA NO BID $3.21 EA NO BID
14. 3.5mm Audio $248.64 $555. $271.95 $356.31
Cable (111)
NO BID $239.25EA | NO BID NO BID $370. EA NO BID $278.91 EA NO BID
15. Unshielded $957.00 OR $1,480. $1,115.64
Plenum Speaker $1,051.78
Wire (4) EA




